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Biography 
Dr. Khleif earned his M.D. from the University of Jordan in Amman in 1986. He completed his 
internal medicine residency at the Medical College of Ohio in 1990 and then joined the NCI as a 
medical oncology fellow. Currently, Dr. Khleif is head of the Cancer Vaccine Section, Vaccine 
Branch at the NCI; he also serves as a Special Assistant to the Commissioner of the Food and 
Drug Administration, leading the Critical Path Initiative for oncology. He also holds an adjunct 
academic appointment with the Medicine Department of the Uniformed Services University of 
the Health Sciences. Dr. Khleif serves on many local, national, and international committees and 
as a cancer vaccine expert for a number of national organizations. From 2002 to 2006, Dr. Khleif 
served as the Director General and CEO of the King Hussein Cancer Center as part of an 
agreement between the NCI and Jordan. During this time, Dr. Khleif led the development of the 
only cancer center in the Middle East into an internationally recognized comprehensive cancer 
center of excellence. In 2007, Dr. Khleif was appointed the Director of the King Hussein Institute 
for Biotechnology and Cancer. This appointment was the result of a new agreement between the 
NCI and Jordan to develop this new institute as a comprehensive cancer center and biotechnology 
research hub. 
 
Research 
Cancer Vaccine Development  
 
Dr. Khleif's research focuses on integrating translational basic laboratory research and clinical 
trials to understand the interaction between tunor cells and the immune system and to develop 
cancer vaccines. His laboratory's emphasis is on the preclinical identification of potential new 
vaccine targets, the development of improved and more effective methods for vaccine delivery, 
an expanded understanding of the mechanism of immune response in vaccinated patients, and the 
incorporation of these findings into clinical trial development. His research has a special 
emphasis on viral and cellular oncogene antigenic potentials.  
 


